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Merve Esmebasi is a recipient of the Singapore International 
Graduate Award and she is currently pursuing her Ph.D. at the 
National University of Singapore. She works as a Teaching and 
Research Assistant in the Architecture Department. Her research 
interest centers on exploring how sound is perceived in a built 
environment. Merve obtained her B.Arch and M.Sc degrees from 
Middle East Technical University, Turkey. After completing her 
Master's dissertation in architectural acoustics, she worked for 
over five years as an acoustics consultant on notable projects in 
various architectural functions. Additionally, she worked as a part-
time instructor of the Acoustics in Architecture lecture at Cankaya 
University, Turkey. During these years, Merve continued to attend 
in-person and online conferences held in Portugal, Hong Kong, 
Turkey, the Republic of Korea, and Singapore to present and follow 
the current research in the field. She received the Young 
Professionals Grant from The Institute of Noise Control 
Engineering for her presentation at the Taming Noise and Moving 
Quiet conference in Hong Kong. Currently, Merve's doctoral 
research focuses on audio-visual interaction in cognition, with the 
aim of creating pleasant architectural spaces that serve the well-
being of their occupants.  
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